
In compliance with the Spanish Law 34/2022, of July 11, of services of the information society and 
electronic commerce, LYMBUS LIFE, S.L., informs you that it is the owner of the website 
www.kilianjornet.cat, in accordance with the requirement of Article 10 of the aforementioned Law, 
LYMBUS LIFE, S.L., notifies the following data: the owner of this website is LYMBUS LIFE, S.L., with 
NIF/CIF: B65971681, Commercial Register of Barcelona, volume 43604, sheet 121, Page 43307, and 
registered office at Comte Borrell 62, CP. 08015, town: Barcelona, Province: Barcelona. The e-mail 
address for contacting the company is info@lymbus.com.  

In accordance with the provisions of the Spanish Organic Law and the General Regulation-EU-
2016/679 of the European Parliament and Council of Europe on the Protection of Personal Data, 
approved on April 27, 2016, LYMBUS LIFE, S.L. informs users of its websites that we are obliged to 
keep professional secrecy about the personal data collected by the company through the forms 
located on its pages, this obligation will continue even after the end of our business or contractual 
relationship, and in no case we can make public the personal data of visitors and customers to the 
web without their consent. Children under the age of 13 cannot give their consent for a business to 
collect and process their personal data; only their legal representatives (parents or guardians) can do 
so on their behalf. Merchants who need to process data from children under 13 must have the means 
to obtain consent from their parents or guardians, for example, by sending an e-mail message to one 
of them containing a link to an electronic form. Children under the age of 13 may not be asked for 
family information, the only exception being identification and contact information for parents or 
guardians. 

MAILINGS AND COMMERCIAL COMMUNICATIONS 

If you have filled out the Newsletter Form, we inform you that by checking the consent box, we are 
entitled to send you commercial communications about activities, projects, products and 
collaborations that Kilian Jornet undertakes, as well as to send you inspirational content about the 
outdoor world, sports, nature and the environment.  

If you have filled out the Form on the Special Notice that will take place on March 23, 2022, we inform 
you that by checking the consent box, we are entitled to inform you of the day, time and means by 
which you will be able to access Kilian's communication, as well as that we may transfer your e-mail 
address to THE NORMAL COMPANY, which is in charge of organizing the aforementioned 
communication and, subsequently, to keep you informed of the evolution and news of the Project. 
Apart from this transfer, we inform you that we will not transfer your data to any third party except 
by legal obligation or by requirements of an administrative or judicial authority. 

Also, LYMBUS LIFE, S.L.  informs of the possibility of exercising the rights of access, which allows the 
web user to know what personal data has the administrator of this page and in this case answer within 
30 days, provided you keep the data, rectification, which allows correct errors, modify data that are 
inaccurate or incomplete and ensure the accuracy of the information, opposition that may request 
and get not to carry out the processing of data, suppression, which allows the deletion of inadequate 
or excessive data, limitation, whereby you can request that the processing of your data be limited 
when you have exercised your right to rectify your personal data, and portability, so that the user can 
obtain a copy of the personal data you have provided on the web in order to transmit them to other 
services, these rights may be exercised by any means that leaves evidence of sending and receiving 
them to the address: GALA PLACIÍDIA 3. Postal Code: 08006. City: BARCELONA. Province: BARCELONA. 
E-mail: store@lymbus.com, providing a photocopy of your ID card or alternative documentation 
proving your identity. 



As long as you do not inform us otherwise, we will understand that your data have not been modified, 
that you agree to notify us of any change and that we have the consent to use them in order to be 
able to maintain the relationship between the parties. 

The sending of your data through the form(s) of our website will be subject to the condition that you 
have read/accepted the Privacy Policy, by means of a mandatory check box at the bottom of the form. 

The sending of your data through the form(s) of our website will be subject to the condition that you 
have read/accepted the Privacy Policy, by means of a mandatory check box at the bottom of the form. 

In accordance with the provisions of Spanish Law 34/2002, of Services of the Information Society and 
Electronic Commerce in Article 21, we ask for your consent to send advertising communications that 
we believe may be of interest to you, by email or any other means of electronic communication 
equivalent, this consent will accept or deny with a mandatory check box at the bottom of the form. 

USER AND RESPONSIBILITIES 

The navigation by access or use of the website www.kilianjornet.cat and all subdomains and 
directories included under it, as well as the services or content that can be obtained through it and all 
domain portals under ownership of LYMBUS LIFE, S.L., grants the condition of User, by which they 
accept, when browsing the page LYMBUS LIFE S.L., all the conditions of use set forth herein without 
prejudice to the application of the corresponding regulations of legal obligation as appropriate. 

 


